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24.09x Minds and Machines 

René Descartes, “Sixth Meditation: the real distinction 
between mind and body” 

Excerpts from René Descartes, Meditations, in The Philosophical Writings of Descartes, translated by J. 
Cottingham, R. Stoothoff, and Dugald Murdoch (Cambridge, 1984). 

In the final Meditation, Descartes is “beginning to achieve a better knowledge of 

[himself] and the author of [his] being”, a non-deceiving God. The all-encompassing 

doubt at the end of the first Meditation is in retreat: “although I do not think I should 

heedlessly accept everything I seem to have acquired from the senses, neither do I think 

that everything should be called into doubt”. In these excerpts, Descartes argues that the 

mind and body are “completely different”, although nonetheless “very closely joined”: 

…I know that everything which I clearly and distinctly understand is capable 
of being created by God so as to correspond exactly with my understanding 
of it. Hence the fact that I can clearly and distinctly understand one thing 
apart from another is enough to make me certain that the two things are 
distinct, since they are capable of being separated, at least by God. The 
question of what kind of power is required to bring about such a separation 
does not affect the judgement that the two things are distinct. Thus, simply 
by knowing that I exist and seeing at the same time that absolutely nothing 
else belongs to my nature or essence except that I am a thinking thing, I can 
infer correctly that my essence consists solely in the fact that I am a thinking 
thing. It is true that I may have (or, to anticipate, that I certainly have) a body 
that is very closely joined to me. But nevertheless, on the one hand I have a 
clear and distinct idea of myself, in so far as I am simply a thinking, non-
extended thing; and on the other hand I have a distinct idea of body, in so 
far as this is simply an extended, non-thinking thing. And accordingly, it is 
certain that I am really distinct from my body, and can exist without it. . . .  

There is nothing that my own nature teaches me more vividly than that I have 
a body, and that when I feel pain there is something wrong with the body, 
and that when I am hungry or thirsty the body needs food and drink, and so 
on. So I should not doubt that there is some truth in this.  

Nature also teaches me, by these sensations of pain, hunger, thirst and so on, 
that I am not merely present in my body as a sailor is present in a ship, but 
that I am very closely joined and, as it were, intermingled with it, so that I and 
the body form a unit. If this were not so, I, who am nothing but a thinking 
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thing, would not feel pain when the body was hurt, but would perceive the 
damage purely by the intellect, just as a sailor perceives by sight if anything 
in his ship is broken. Similarly, when the body needed food or drink, I should 
have an explicit understanding of the fact, instead of having confused 
sensations of hunger and thirst. For these sensations of hunger, thirst, pain 
and so on are nothing but confused modes of thinking which arise from the 
union and, as it were, intermingling of the mind with the body. . . .  

There is a great difference between the mind and the body, inasmuch as the 
body is by its very nature always divisible, while the mind is utterly indivisible. 
For when I consider the mind, or myself in so far as I am merely a thinking 
thing, I am unable to distinguish any parts within myself; I understand myself 
to be something quite single and complete. Although the whole mind seems 
to be united to the whole body, I recognize that if a foot or arm or any other 
part of the body is cut off, nothing has thereby been taken away from the 
mind. As for the faculties of willing, of understanding, of sensory perception 
and so on, these cannot be termed parts of the mind, since it is one and the 
same mind that wills, and understands and has sensory perceptions. By 
contrast, there is no corporeal or extended thing that I can think of which in 
my thought I cannot easily divide into parts; and this very fact makes me 
understand that it is divisible. This one argument would be enough to show 
me that the mind is completely different from the body, even if I did not 
already know as much from other considerations.  


